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1.0 PURPOSE  
   

1.1 The purpose of this report is to seek approval of the proposals for the Clune Park area set out 
in the Clune Park Masterplan 

 

   
2.0 SUMMARY  

   
2.1 Hypostyle Architects were commissioned by the Council and River Clyde Homes to prepare a 

masterplan for the Clune Park area of Port Glasgow. The masterplan has been prepared and 
includes as its focus the redevelopment of the tenemental area to the north of Robert Street for 
a mix of 80 new build houses and flats, based on the current street pattern. Proposals are also 
made for other sites in and around Clune Park in order to improve the overall appearance and 
amenity of the area. 

 

   
3.0 RECOMMENDATIONS  

   
3.1 It is recommended that the Committee approve the proposals for the future development of the 

Clune Park area set out in the Clune Park Masterplan and attached as Appendix 1 as the vision 
for the redevelopment of this area, and that the Council engage with its partners, including 
River Clyde Homes and the Scottish Government, with a view to exploring delivery. 

 

 
 
Scott Allan 
Corporate Director 
Environment, Regeneration & Resources 
 

 
 



 
4.0 BACKGROUND  

   
4.1 The Clune Park area is identified as a priority for regeneration in the Council’s Local Housing 

Strategy, Strategic Housing Investment Plan and Local Development Plan. As an outcome of 
discussions with Scottish Government officials, it was agreed that the Council would prepare 
a masterplan for the future regeneration of the area. River Clyde Homes, as a strategic 
housing partner of the Council, and a registered social landlord with housing stock in the 
Clune Park area, agreed to partner the Council in the commissioning of the masterplan. 

 

   
5.0 CLUNE PARK MASTERPLAN  

   
5.1 Following a competitive tender, Hypostyle Architects were appointed in November 2017 to 

prepare a masterplan for the Clune Park area. Hypostyle’s process for preparing the 
masterplan has involved a baseline consultation event in the Clune Park Resource centre in 
February 2018, an exhibition of initial proposals in the Clune Park Resource Centre and Port 
Glasgow library in May 2018, an all members briefing in June 2018, and a series of meetings 
with the client team consisting of officials from the Council, River Clyde Homes and the 
Scottish Government. 

 

   
5.2 The initial stage of Hypostyle’s commission was to undertake a desktop review of previous 

reports covering the Clune Park area, particularly the ODS Housing Options Study from June 
2006 and the Housing Condition and Social Survey from 2011. Hypostyle’s recommendation 
were that the new build options from the ODS study be reviewed in the context of current 
housing needs, local housing providers, tenure balance and current funding routes. 

 

   
5.3 Hypostyle then proceeded to develop a masterplan for the area based on the area north of 

Robert Street being cleared following demolition. This process involved the exploration of 
options including bringing some or all of the underused Glasgow Road to the north of Clune 
Park into the development area and the removal of the roundabout at the western edge of the 
site and its replacement with a new road layout. The study also looked at the wider area 
around Clune Park to see where enhancements could be made. 

 

   
5.4 The masterplan’s final proposals are included for approval as Appendix 1. The key proposals 

are listed below: 
 
North of Robert Street – the development of the current tenemental area for 35 
houses/townhouses and 45 flats, 80 units in total. The existing street layout would remain with 
development fronting onto Robert Street and terraced development down one side of each of 
Bruce Street, Wallace Street, Clune Park Street and Maxwell Street. 
 
Clune Park school – the masterplan recommends the retention and reuse of this building is 
explored, particularly its façade onto Robert Street, with the area behind developed for a mix 
of community, workspace and residential uses. It is suggested that an energy centre could be 
integrated into the area immediately behind the retained façade, which would power the new 
and possibly existing properties. 
 
Clune Park church - the masterplan recommends the retention and reuse of this building is 
explored. The church has potential for community use, with the land to the rear for residential 
development. 
 
Entrance area – proposals are presented for a mix of flats and houses fronting onto Ashgrove 
Lane and Clune Brae at the western entrance to the site. 
 
Clune Brae – proposals are presented to: reduce speeding, improve and create pedestrian 
crossing points; improve bus infrastructure; and formalise on street parking arrangements. 
Two opportunities for residential or commercial development are identified on gap sites on 
Clue Brae. 
 
Garage site – the masterplan recommends aesthetic improvements at the western entrance 
to Clune Park so to improve the overall appearance of the area. The garage site is recognised 

 



as having possible long term redevelopment potential. 
 
Newark Street – possible development opportunities are identified in the Newark Street area. 

   
5.5  Whilst the comprehensive nature of the masterplan is welcomed, the Council’s focus is the 

redevelopment of the tenemental area to the north of Robert Street. The masterplan provides 
a vision for the redevelopment of this area, with which the Council can engage with its 
partners, including River Clyde Homes and the Scottish Government, with a view to exploring 
delivery. 

 

   
6.0 IMPLICATIONS  

   
 Finance  
   

6.1 There are no financial implications arising from this report.  
   
 Financial Implications:  

 
One off Costs 
 

Cost Centre Budget 
Heading 

Budget  
Years 

Proposed 
Spend this 
Report 

Virement 
From 

Other Comments 

N/A 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
Annually Recurring Costs/ (Savings) 
 

Cost Centre Budget 
Heading 

With 
Effect 
from 

Annual Net 
Impact 

Virement 
From (If 
Applicable) 

Other Comments 

N/A 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

 

   
 Legal  
   

6.2  There are no legal implications arising from this report.  
   
 Human Resources  
   

6.3 There are no personnel issues arising from this report.  
   
 Equalities  
   

6.4 There are no equalities issues arising from this report.  
   
 Repopulation  
   

6.5 The implementation of the proposals set out in the masterplan would result in the creation of 
an attractive residential environment in a 

 

   
7.0 CONSULTATIONS  

   
7.1 The Clune Park masterplan has been prepared in consultation with River Clyde Homes and 

the Scottish Government. 
 

   
8.0 LIST OF BACKGROUND PAPERS   

   
8.1 Clune Park Regeneration Report (September 2018) – full report  

   
 Appendix 1: Clune Park masterplan final proposal  
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